
 

 

 

EXHALL EXPECTS 
YOU TO... 

Pupils/Students Staff 
Be where you should be on time. Be at your designated work area on 

time, ready to work and create a 
welcoming learning environment. 

Be prepared with basic equipment 
(pen, pencil) and ready to learn.  

Be there at the beginning of the 
lesson, planned and prepared.  

Wear school uniform. When in 
lessons/learning spaces remove 
outdoor clothing including hoodies. 

Dress in an appropriate and 
professional manner and remove 
outdoor clothing when in 
lessons/learning spaces. 

Be respectful to staff and other 
pupils/students and understand that 
everyone has the right to learn. 

Be respectful to pupils/students and 
staff and be informed about 
pupils/students needs. 

Follow the school policy of no mobile 
phones. 

Only use a mobile phone in the 
presence of pupils/students if it is a 
work mobile and related to work. 

Recognise that tasks are not always 
easy, and work will be challenging but 
ensure you always try your best. 

Recognise that work will be 
challenging but ensure you always 
give your best, building and 
modelling resilience. 

Understand that all actions have 
consequences both positive and 
negative. 

Address both positive and negative 
behaviours fairly and according to 
pupil need.  

Communicate your needs, likes and 
dislikes politely and with respect.  

Communicate politely and with 
respect to all pupils/students and 
staff. 

Be prepared to give things another go, 
even after you feel that things have 
gone wrong. 

Be prepared to restore and rebuild a 
relationship with pupils/students or 
staff so that you can move on 
positively. 
 

.... and ‘Be Your Best Self’ 
 

Remember the school values of Respect, Resilience, Confidence, 

Integrity, Aspiration and Motivation. 


